BUYER: CHRISTIE KELLY

6359 OF
ATTACHMENT "A-1"

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 24, 2021

REVISED
TSB
2021 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR HALF TON CREW CAB 4X4-4 DOOR TRUCKS (REGULAR) ANDERSON FORD BAXTER CDJRF GENE STEFFY AUTO HUSKER AUTO SID DILLION FORD
OF LINCOLN GROUP
LINE # DESCRIPTION Qry | uom UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
#**DO NOT BID BASE/WORK TRUCK MODEL***
1 |2021 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 50 EA 33,613.00 NO BID NO BID NB 33,230.00
HALF TON CREW CAB 4X4-4 DOOR TRUCKS (REGULAR) FEV E85 BIDDING A 2022 MODEL YEAR
E85=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL MIXTURE OF UP TO 85% ETHANOL / 15% UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR CONVERSION
A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE FUEL VEHICLES. A SEPARATE CONTRACT MAY BE AWARDED.
WHEELBASE MINIMUM OF 145": 145" 145
MINIMUM TIRE SIZE 17": 17" 17
MAKE: Ford FORD
MODEL: F150 F-150
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL: WIE, 300A, XLT WIE, F-150, XLT
ENGINE 5.0LV8 5.0L
(MINIMUM SIZE OF 5.0L V8): NO BID NO BID NB
GVWR 7050 7050
(MINIMUM OF 6,800):
TRANSMISSION #/GEAR RATIO #: 3.31 Elocking 44G-10 SPEED
DELIVERY ARO: 90 90-180
(NUMBER OF DAYS):
MSRP: $ 49,045.00
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2 |2021 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 50 EA |$ 33,613.00 | $ 29,880.00 [ $ 30,413.00| $ 37,099.00 | $ 33,230.00
HALF TON CREW CAB 4X4-4 DOOR TRUCKS (REGULAR) E15 COMPLIANT BIDDING A 2022 MODEL YEAR
E85=UNITS CAPABLE OF OPERATING ON A FUEL MIXTURE OF UP TO 85% ETHANOL / 15% UNLEADED GASOLINE WITHOUT ADDITIONAL CHANGE OR CONVERSION
A SEPARATE BID IS REQUESTED IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE FUEL VEHICLES. A SEPARATE CONTRACT MAY BE AWARDED.
WHEELBASE MINIMUM OF 145" 145" 149.5 149.5 156.95" 145
MINIMUM TIRE SIZE 17" 17" 17" 17" P265/65R18 17
MAKE: Ford RAM RAM GM CHEVROLET FORD
MODEL: F150 1500 CLASSIC 1500 SLT SILVERADO-CREW CAB F 150
SERIES, CODE, TRIM LEVEL: WIE, 300A, XLT CREW CAB4 X 4 DS6HI1 1500-CK10743 LT WIE, F 150, XLT
6'4" BOX SLT 26G
DSGH91
ENGINE 5.0LV8 5.7 5.7LV8 184 5.3L 5.0L
(MINIMUM SIZE OF 5.0L V8): ECOTEC V8
GVWR 7050 6900 # 6900 7100 LB 7050
(MINIMUM OF 6,800):
TRANSMISSION #/GEAR RATIO #: 3.31 Elocking 8 SP. AUTO 8HP70 3.21 MQE-8SP/ 446, 10 SPEED
DELIVERY ARO: 90 90-120 90-120 DAYS 180/240 90-180
(NUMBER OF DAYS):
MSRP: $ $ 49,045.00 | $ 48,395.00[ $ 48,770.00] $ 50,470.00
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THE LINES BELOW ARE ADDITIONAL ITEMS, REFERRED TO AS "OPTIONS", WHICH ARE NOT INCLUDED IN THE ITB "CORE ITEMS".
BIDS AND FURTHER DESCRIPTION REQUESTS ARE TO BE FURNISHED IN THE SPECIFIED AREAS ON THE LINES BELOW.
THIS LINE WILL BE REMOVED ON THE FINAL CONTRACT, AS WELL AS ANY "OPTION" LINES WHICH DO NOT APPLY OR BID COSTS AND/OR REQUESTED INFORMATION HAS NOT BEEN PROVIDED.
3 |ENGINE (OTHER GAS) 50 EA S 1,295.00 NA S 28,686.00 DEDUCTION BID PRICE
S $ 2,362.00
PLEASE SPECIFY ENGINE SIZE: 3.5L Ecoboost 3.6L V6 ONLY AVAILABLE L38 2.7L TURBO E15
WITH 5'7" BOX 3.5L ECOBOOST
4 |ENGINE (OTHER DIESEL) TO INCLUDE BLOCK HEATER. 50 EA N/A NA NA S 2,590.00 |$ 4,546.00
PLEASE SPECIFY ENGINE SIZE: LM2 DURAMAX 3.0L 3.0L POWER STROKE
5 ]40-20-40 OR 60-40 VINYL BENCH SEAT WITH LUMBAR SUPPORT 50 EA DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE | DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE
(DEDUCT) N/A NA NA NA NA
6 |VINYL COVERED BUCKET SEATS WITH ARM RESTS ON BOTH THE RIGHT AND 50 EA N/A NA NA NA NA
LEFT HAND SIDES
7 |CLOTH FILLED, VINYL TRIM BUCKET SEATS WITH ARM RESTS ON BOTH THE 50 EA S 395.00 | ¢ 1,192.00 | ¢ 1,295.00 NA 3 395.00
RIGHT AND RIGHT AND LEFT SIDES
8 |40-20-40 OR 60-40 BENCH SEAT WITH DRIVER POWER CONTROLS 50 EA S 395.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 397.00| $ 350.00
ONLY
9 |LUMBAR SUPPORT FRONT SEATS 50 EA STD-Driver $ 500.00 | $ 450.00 STD $ 350.00
(IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)
10 |ELECTRONIC COMPASS/TEMPERATURE DISPLAY: 50 EA DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE | DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE
(DEDUCT) N/A N/A STD NA NA
11 |HEAVY DUTY, HIGH OUTPUT, STANDARD EQUIPMENT ALTERNATOR: 50 EA DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE | DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE
(DEDUCT) NA NA NA NA NA
12 |SLIDING REAR-VISION WINDOW: 50 EA S 395.00| $ 180.00| $ 195.00 | $ 1,199.00 NA
(DEALER INSTALLED) REQUIRES PCM PKG
13 |SECOND POWER OUTLET: 50 EA S 155.00 NA S 200.00 STD NA
14 |INCREASED BOX LENGTH OF 8' WITH CORRESPONDING WHEELBASE. 50 EA N/A NA NA NA S 927.00
SPECIFY LENGTH AND WIDTH OF BOX: 6.4 6'5" INSTEAD OF 8'
SPECIFY WIDTH BETWEEN WHEEL WELLS:
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15 |TRAILER TOWING PACKAGE: 50 EA DEDUCTION BID PRICE | DEDUCTION BID PRICE | DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE
(DEDUCT) $ 125.00 | $ 589.00 | $ 800.00 NA NA
16 |CARGO LIGHT IN THE BOX AREA 50 EA STD INCL. INCL 199.00 INCL
17 |ADDITIONAL FOB 50 EA | s 295.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 199.00 | $ 149.00
(IF EQUIPPED WITH KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY)
18 |NON-STANDARD GEAR RATIO(S) 50 EA | s 570.00 | DEDUCTION BID PRICE | $ 95.00 NA $ 420.00
$ 88.00
PLEASE SPECIFY: 3.73 ELOCKING 3.21 3.92 3.73 ELEC. LOCKING
19 |TWO WHEEL DRIVE (2WD) MODEL INCLUDING ALL SEASON TIRES 50 EA DEDUCTION BID PRICE | DEDUCTION BID PRICE | DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE DEDUCTION BID PRICE
(DEDUCT) $ 1,995.00 N/A $ 2,009.00 1,499.00 | $ 1,600.00
20 |ON/OFF ROAD MUD AND SNOW ALL TERRAIN MINIMUM 17" 50 EA P265/65R18
TIRES (SIZE, PLY RATING, AND COST): 265/70 R17 17" LT265/17RE LT265/70R 17 E ALL TERRAIN LT 265/70817C
$ 795.00 | $ 231.00] $ 250.00 299.00 | $ 295.00
WHEELS (SIZE, PLY RATING, AND COST): NA 17 E LT275/65R18 6 PLY 3
17" ALUMINUM ALL TERRAIN
INCLUDED 599.00
SPARE (SIZE, PLY RATING, AND COST): 265/70R17 NA 17 E N/A $
$ 395.00
21 |SPARE TIRE RIM MAY BE STEEL 50 EA INCLUDED INCL. STD STD NA
22 |INTEGRATED BRAKE CONTROLLER SYSTEM 50 EA INCLUDED INCL. S 295.00 399.00 | $ 275.00
23 |REAR VISION CAMERA 50 EA INCLUDED INCL. STD STD INCL
(IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)
24 |DEALER INSTALLED TAILGATE STEP 50 EA |$ 375.00 NA $ 425.00 NA $ 420.00
25 |TRAILER SWAY CONTROL SYSTEM 50 EA INCLUDED INCL. STD NA-STD INCL
26 |KEYLESS REMOTE ENTRY 50 EA INCLUDED INCL. $ 200.00 299.00 INCL
(INCLUDES TWO (2) FOBS AND TWO (2) SETS OF KEYS TO ENTER THE
27 |FACTORY BED LINER FOR BOX 50 EA |$ 595.00 | $ 548.00| $ 595.00 595.00 | $ 475.00
SPRAY-IN
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2021 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR HALF TON CREW CAB 4X4-4 DOOR TRUCKS (REGULAR)

ANDERSON FORD
OF LINCOLN

BAXTER CDJRF

GENE STEFFY AUTO
GROUP

HUSKER AUTO

SID DILLION FORD

28

REVERSE SENSING SYSTEM

50

EA

INCLUDED

$

S 250.00 | $

399.00

441.00

29

SMALLER FUEL TANK SIZE
(DEDUCT)
SPECIFY FUEL TANK SIZE:

50

EA

DEDUCTION BID PRICE
S 200.00
22

DEDUCTION BID PRICE

$

409.00
26 Gallon

DEDUCTION BID PRICE
$ 400.00

DEDUCTION BID PRICE

NA

$

DEDUCTION BID PRICE

292.00

30

TOW PACKAGE UPGRADE

SPECIFY EQUIPMENT:

SPECIFY HITCH CLASS:

SPECIFY MAXIMUM TRAILER WEIGHT:

50

EA

S 1,090.00

ENGINE OIL COOLER, PRO-
TRAILER ASSIST

\

9,400

NA

NA

NA

NA

31

FRONT END TOWING HOOKS

50

EA

STD

INCL.

INC S

96.00

150.00

32

PROTECTIVE VINYL BODY MOLDING
(DEALER INSTALLED IF NOT STANDARD EQUIPMENT)

50

EA

S 495.00

NA

S 350.00 | $

359.00

350.00

33

MANUFACTURER'S WIRELESS BLUETOOTH TECHNOLOGY
(DEDUCT)

50

EA

DEDUCTION BID PRICE
NA

DEDUCTION BID PRICE

NA

DEDUCTION BID PRICE
STD

DEDUCTION BID PRICE

NA

DEDUCTION BID PRICE

NA

34

EQUIPMENT/ENGINE SERVICE REPAIR MANUAL
PLEASE SPECIFY IF PAPER COPY, CD ROM OR ON-LINE:

50

EA

$ 295.00
CD ROM

NA

S 150.00
CD ROM

NA

295.00

35

PARTS REPAIR MANUAL
PLEASE SPECIFY IF PAPER COPY, CD ROM OR ON-LINE:

50

EA

N/A

NA

NA

NA

NA

36

ALTERNATOR WITH HIGHEST AMP OUTPUT
PLEASE SPECIFY AMPERAGE:
LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY

50

EA

N/A

NA

NA

NA

NA

37

100 WATT SIREN SPEAKER INSTALLED BEHIND FRONT GRILL AND CENTERED
ON THE PUSH BUMPER (LEADS TAGGED AS SUCH THAT TERMINATE IN OR
NEAR THE PASSENGER COMPARTMENT)

LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY

50

EA

S 325.00

NA

S 268.00] $

368.00

368.00

38

SETINA PB400 PUSH BUMPER INSTALLED ON THE FRONT OF THE VEHICLE
LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY

50

EA

S 598.00

NA

S 709.00 | $

957.00

799.00

39

AUXILIARY DUAL PURPOSE AGM BATTTERY WITH DUAL BATTERY SEPARATOR
FOR ACCESSORY EQUIPMENT. INSTALLATION SHALL INLCUDE BATTERY TRAY
AND BRACKET, AND A HEAVY DUTY FUSE, MINIMUM 1 GAUGE CABLE.

PLEASE SPECIFY CCA:
LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY

50

EA

S 1,090.00

750

NA

S 850.00 | $

750

993.00

835.00

40

DEALER INSTALLED DOME/COURTESY LAMP TO BE CENTERED AT A MINIMUM
4" FROM THE TOP OF THE WINDSHIELD AND CONTROLLED BY THE ROTATING
HEADLAMP SWITCH OR A SEPARATE SWITCH TO REACH MAXIMUM POSITION
(THIS MAY REQUIRE AN ADDITIONAL LIGHT).

LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY

50

EA

$ 195.00

NA

S 200.00 | $

209.00

195.00

41

STANDARD PAINT
(ATTACH NO ADDITIONAL COST PAINTS LIST)

10,000

$0.00
STD

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
SEE ATTACHED
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42 [EXTRA COST PAINT 10000 $ |3 395.00| $ 1.00] $ 1.00] $ 495.00 $1.00
(ATTACH EXTRA COST PAINTS LIST) SEE CHART
43 |NDOT USE ONLY (CHOOSE FROM THE FOLLOWING YELLOW COLOR CODES): 50 EA NA
NA
DODGE: #PL1: $ $ 450.00 >
NA PYB-P63
FORD #84553: $ 995.00 $ NA $ 660.00
CHEVY/GMC #WA-253A CODE (9W3): S 3 s 495.00 | $
44 |ADDITIONAL MANUFACTURER WARRANTY COST(S) 50 EA | S 2,995.00 NA $ 3,000.00 NC CALL FOR OPTIONS
SPECIFY YEARS AND MILES: 5 YEARS, 100,000 MILES 5 YR 100,000 5YR/100,000 MILE POWER
FORD PREMIUM CARE $100 $100.00 DED TRAIN 5YR/100,000 MILE ROAD
DEDUCTIBLE SIDE ASSISTANCE
45 |DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES OUTSIDE THE LINCOLN AREA 1 MILE
(DROP SHIPMENT CHARGES APPLY TO VEHICLES PURCHASED BY POLITICAL
SUBDIVISIONS AND OTHER DIVISIONS OF GOVERNMENT) $2.00 $3.00 $1.00 $3.00 $2.00
PER MILE PER MILE PER MILE PER MILE PER MILE
PAYMENT TERMS: 030 030 030 030
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 90 120 180/240 180/240
COMMENTS:
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